ROWAN COUNTY

DEPARTMENTAL REQUEST FOR BUDGET ACTION

TO: Board of Commissioners
FROM: Finance

EXPLANATION IN DETAIL: To transfer funds to cover Precinct Workers and Part Time Salaries
through the end of the fiscal year.

Prepared by: Teresa Sharpless QQ
Date: 4/4/2022
BUDGET INFORMATION:
ACCOUNT TITLE R/E| ACCOUNT # INCREASE DECREASE
Municipal Elections Revenue R 1144170-425006 12,875
Training E 1154170-559000 4,300
Health Insurance E 1154170-520005 7,500
Social Security Tax E 1154170-520020 1,325
Retirement E 1154170-520015 1,000
Precinct Workers E 1154170-534045 12,000
Part Time Salaries E 1154170-510015 15,000
DEPARTMENT HEAD COUNTY MANAGER ACCOUNTING USE ONLY
Approved: s Approved: Budget Revision# | [ ) -\
Disapproved: Disapproved: Date Posted:
Amended: Amended: Group Number:
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ROWAN COUNTY
DEPARTMENTAL REQUEST FOR BUDGET ACTION

TO: BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

FROM: SHERIFF

EXPLANATION IN DETAIL: RECOGNIZE INSURANCE PAYMENT RECEIVED ‘
FROM WRECKED ASSET FORFEITURE VEHICLE :
AND PLACE FUNDS IN THE PROPER EXPENSE {
CAPITAL ASSET: ASSET FORFEITURE ACCOUNT
TO ALLOW FOR PURCHASE OF REPLACEMENT
VEHICLE.
Prepared by: Major ] C Sifford
Date: 3/30/2022
Reviewed:
ACCOUNT TITLE R/H ACCOUNT # INCREASE DECREASE
INSURANCE SETTLEMENT R 11444162-§39030 15,308
C/A: ASSET FORFEITURE 11544162-575005 15,308
i
!
i
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Sifford, John

= T %20
From: Sifford, John
Sent: Monday, March 28, 2022 12:51 PM
To: ‘Bevis, Lisa F'
Subject: RE: Question on Insurance Settlement Money

Thanks Lisa! !

From: Bevis, Lisa F <Lisa.Bevis@rowancountync.gov>
Sent: Monday, March 28, 2022 12:40 PM

To: Sifford, John <John.Sifford@rowancountync.gov>
Subject: RE: Question on Insurance Settlement Money

Yes please prepare a BA acknowledging the revenue and then your corresponding Fed Asset Forfeiture expense account.

From: Sifford, John

Sent: Monday, March 28, 2022 12:28 PM

To: Bevis, Lisa F <Lisa.Bevis@rowancountync.gov>
Subject: Question on Insurance Settlement Money

Lisa,

I know we got the insurance money for the wrecked Altima that had been assigned to Chief Deputy David Ramsey, and it
looks like those funds were placed into revenue account #11444162-489030 (Insurance Settlements). | just wanted to
confirm that [ need to do a Budget Amendment to move these funds from the revenue account t!o the proper expense
account to allow for the purchase of a replacement vehicle? | think the proper expense account would be #11544162-
575005 C/A: Asset Forfeiture?

Just advise when you have a minute.
Thanks,
John

Major John C. Sifford

Rowan County Sheriff’s Office
Administrative and Support Services
232 N. Main St.

Salisbury, NC 28144

(704)-216-8668

john.sifford@rowancountync.gov
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ROWAN COUNTY

DEPARTMENTAL REQUEST FOR BUDGET ACTION

TO: BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
FROM: FINANCE
EXPLANATION IN DETAIL: To recognize reserved funds from FY 2021 for the Sheriff's Office. Reserved funds

represent money received by a Department for a restricted purpose. The funds
that have not been spent by year-end are budgeted for expenditure in the new

fiscal year.
Prepared by: Lisa Bevis
Date: 04/01/22
BUDGET INFORMATION: Reviewed:
ACCOUNT TITLE ACCOUNT # INCREASE DECREASE
Fund Balance Appropriated - Restricted R 1144410-495010 3,070
Calendar E 1154410-582015 3,070
DEPARTMENT HEAD COUNTY MANAGER ACCOUNTING USE ONLY
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Bevis, Lisa F
e e e e Tl T S L R W P P s BT =" 2

From: Sifford, John

Sent: Thursday, March 31, 2022 4:.04 PM

To: Bevis, Lisa F

Cc: Auten, Kevin

Subject: Request to budget Reserve Calendar funds left available as of 6-30-2021
Attachments: FY -21 Reserves as of June 30, 2021.pdf

Lisa,

| hope that this message finds you doing well!!

Please see the attached copy of the Rowan County Sheriff's Office Reserves prepared by you for fiscal year that ended
on June 30, 2021. | have highlighted the calendar expense account that is near the top right of the page. Itis account
##1154410-582015, and there was an amount of $3,070.31 that was designated as “Remainder to Budget”. At present,
this expense account only has $23.55 left in it, so Sheriff Auten requested that | ask for the Remainder amount of
$3,070.31 be budgeted back into the Calendar Expense account.

Please advise if you need further from the Sheriff or | on this request. Thanks for all of the assistance you provide to us!!
Sincerely,
John

Major John C. Sifford

Rowan County Sheriff's Office
Administrative and Support Services
232 N. Main St.

Salisbury, NC 28144
(704)-216-8668
john.sifford@rowancountync.gov



ROWAN COUNTY

DEPARTMENTAL REQUEST FOR BUDGET ACTION

TO: COUNTY MANAGER / BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

FROM: FINANCE
Requesting a budget amendment to address estimated rest of year

EXPLANATION IN DETAIL: occupancy fees received and paid out to Rowan County TDA.
Prepared by: JHOWDEN
Date: 4/6/2022

BUDGET INFORMATION:

ACCOUNT TITLE R/E ACCOUNT # INCREASE DECREASE
OCCUPANCY TAX REVENUE R 1142314-416010 315,000
OCCUPANCY TAX REMITTANCE E 1154810-583044 315,000
DEPARTMENT HEAD COUNTY MANAGER ACCOUNTING USE ONLY
-
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Disapproved: Disapproved: Keyed By:
Amended: Amended: Date Keyed:
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Rowan County
G/L ACCOUNT - MASTER INQUIRY

org code: 1154810 TOURISM DEVELOPMENT AUTHORITY Type: E
Object code: 583044 OCCUPANCY TAX REMITTANCE Status: A
Project code: Budgetary: Y

Fund 1010  GENERAL FUND

Function 48 ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

Sub Function 4840 TOURISM AUTHORITY

Department 4810 TOURISM DEVELOPMENT AUTHORITY

Division 0000 NON DIVISION

Program 0000 NON PROGRAM

Activity 000 NON ACTIVITY

Type 5 EXPENDITURES
Full description: OCCUPANCY TAX REMITTANCE Short desc: 0OCC TAX RE
Reference Acct: Auto-encumber? (Y/N) N

————————— CURRENT YEAR MONTHLY AMOUNTS ----------
PER ACTUAL ENCUMBRANCE BUD TRANSFER BUDGET

00 .00 .00 .00 .00
01 .00 .00 .00 891,000.00
02 .00 .00 .00 .00
03 104,459.64 .00 .00 .00
04 97,778.94 .00 .00 .00
05 99,784.12 .00 .00 .00
06 114,171.30 .00 .00 .00
07 101,413.78 .00 .00 .00
08 94,915.98 .00 .00 .00
09 95,949.61 .00 .00 .00
10 93,585.30 .00 .00 .00
11 .00 .00 00 .00
12 00 .00 00 00
13 .00 .00 .00 .00
Tot: 802,058.67 .00 .00 891,000.00
—————————— CURRENT YEAR TOTAL AMOUNTS ---------—--
Actual (Memo) 802,058.67 oOriginal Budget 891,000.00
Encumbrances .00 Budget Tranfr In .00
Requisitions .00 Budget Tranfr out
Total 802,058.67 carry Fwd Budget
Available Budget 88,941.33 <carry Fwd Bud Tfr
Percent Used 90.02 Revised Budget
Inceptn to SOY .00 Inceptn Orig Bud
Inceptn Revsd Bud Q00058 =
Encumb-Last Yr .00 DEPARTMENT 8- =
Actual-Last Yr .00 MANAGER 00257250 3
Estim-Actual 891,000.00 PRESENT EEE S o
.00 COMMISSION
APPROVED y gl
| L} f 2 o) A
12- =
j / 2 -
002
B 4 SRERY]
Eggcr):'t generated: ggﬁg;ﬂ’%azz 09:23 r‘&g& 1

Program ID: glacting



ROWAN COUNTY

DEPARTMENTAL REQUEST FOR BUDGET ACTION

TO: COUNTY MANAGER / BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

FROM: Airport

EXPLANATION IN DETAIL:

Request to transfer money from the General Fund, using Article 44
economical development reserves, to the Airport Fund to Purchase large

fan.
Prepared by: JHOWDEN
Date: 4/6/2022
BUDGET INFORMATION:
ACCOUNT TITLE R/E ACCOUNT # INCREASE DECREASE
APPROPRIATED FB - RESTRICTED R 1143390-495010 20,892
TRANSFER TO 603 E 1154112-595603 20,892
TRANSFER FROM 101 R 6344560-491101 20,892
C/A - FURN & EQUIP E 6354560-575090 20,892
DEPARTMENT HEAD COUNTY MANAGER ACCOUNTING USE ONLY
Approved: v Approved: Period - Journal #
Disapproved: Disapproved: Keyed By:
Amended: Amended: Date Keyed:
Date: Lf/-? /3 Y\ Date: Posted By:
Signature: Signature:

- forrdhn

Date Posted:




Howden, James M

= — =
From: Steele, Valerie S
Sent: Thursday, March 31, 2022 1:41 PM
To: Howden, James M; Bevis, Lisa F
Subject: FW: BAF for Hangar

Good Afternoon,
A BA will be needed for the purchase of the large fan for the hangar that Food Lion is in final negotiations to lease.
Total Contract value not to exceed $20,891.75

The BOC approved for me to forward with the purchase during a closed session, so | have provided Anna the Contract
and thought the BA could be done simultaneously.

-Valerie

From: Bumgarner, Anna R

Sent: Thursday, March 31, 2022 1:35 PM

To: Steele, Valerie S <Valerie.Steele @rowancountync.gov>
Subject: RE: BAF for Hangar

I will have this ready to be approved on April 18. If you can work with Finance to create the BA. If the BA need BOC
approval then send me a copy and | will have it added to the agenda item so they are approved together.

Anna

From: Steele, Valerie S

Sent: Thursday, March 31, 2022 8:18 AM

To: Bumgarner, Anna R <Anna.Bumgarner@rowancountync.gov>
Subject: BAF for Hangar

Good Morning Anna,
I have one of the contracts ready to go to the BOC approval. It would be great if it could be on the next agenda?

The fan is part of a lease agreement they have been working on with Food Lion. The BOC approved for me to forward
with the purchase during a closed session, so they won’t be surprised to see the contract come through.

This one will require a BA from the general fund to an airport expense account, possibly to C/A-OTHER IMPROV
6354550-574000-? Do you want to loop in finance or would you like me to do that?

Attached:
Quote
Sole Source Agenda Cover Memo (updated)

Contract w/provider signature

[ have received a COI but the additional insured column was not marked so | am waiting for a corrected version now.
1



Let me know if | missed something or you need anything else. =)

Thanks,
Valerie



